

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Non-Electrical Hand Tools
 TIME & (March 1, 2013 through December 31, 2013)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 28, 2013

Alamo Distribution, LLC
 Alamo Iron Works
 943 AT&T Center Pkwy
 San Antonio, TX 78219

MSC Industrial Supply
 121 Interpark Blvd., Ste. 1203
 San Antonio, TX 78216

PDME, Inc.
 1120 Toro Grande Drive
 Cedar Park, TX 78613

Border States Electric
 2781 Robindale Rd.
 Brownsville, TX 78526

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY					
ITEM 1.	DRILL BIT, MASONRY					
1.	15 ea. Size 1/4" Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	0.74 11.10 Drill America DAM4x1/4	0.99 14.85 Trucut W2504	2.50 37.50 Rock River 0259441	Incomplet
2.	10 ea. Size 3/8" Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	1.30 13.00 Drill America DAM 4x3/8	1.20 12.00 Trucut W 3754	9.50 95.00 Dewalt DW 5249	Incomplete
3.	10 ea. Size 5/16" Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	0.97 9.70 Drill America DAM 4x5/16	1.09 10.90 Trucut W3124	3.50 35.00 Rock River 0259443	Incomplete
4.	5 ea. Size 7/16" Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	1.91 9.55 Drill America DAM 4x7/16	1.81 9.05 Trucut W4376	4.75 23.75 Rock River 0259445	Incomplete
5.	5 ea. Size 9/16" Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	2.56 12.80 Drill America DAM 9/16 x 3/8	2.60 13.00 Trucut W5626	9.00 45.00 Dewalt DW5217	Incomplete
6.	5 ea. Size 3/4" Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	6.96 34.80 Drill America DAM 6x3/4	4.95 24.75 Trucut W7506	28.00 140.00 Dewalt DW5474	Incomplete
7.	5 ea. Size 7/8" Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	7.47 37.35 Drill America DAM 6x7/8	6.56 32.80 Trucut W8756	37.00 185.00 Dewalt DW5477	Incomplete
8.	10 ea. Size 3/16" x 4" Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	0.67 6.70 Drill America DAM 4x3/16	1.90 19.00 Triump Twist Drill 038512	3.80 38.00 Rock River 0259401	Incomplete
9.	5 ea. Size 5/8" x 8", W 3/8" SHANK Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	3.41 17.05 Drill America DAM 6x5/8x3/8	3.59 17.95 Trucut W6256	10.50 52.50 Bosch HCBG20	Incomplete
10.	5 ea. Size 5/8" x 12" Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	6.54 32.70 Drill America DAM 13x5/8x1/2	19.24 96.20 Vermont Amer. 14130	15.75 78.75 Dewalt DW5242	Incomplete
11.	5 ea. Size 1/2" x 12" Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	4.96 24.80 Drill America DAM 13x1/2x3/8	18.24 91.20 Vermont Amer. 14129	11.75 58.75 Dewalt DW5236	Incomplete
12.	5 ea. Size 1/2" x 16" w/ 3/8" SHANK Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	7.80 39.00 Drill America 18x1/2	8.32 41.60 Trucut X50018	16.50 82.50 Bosch HCFC 2087	Incomplete
13.	5 ea. Size 3/4" x 13" CARBIDE TIP Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	9.80 49.00 Drill America DAM 13x3/4	12.43 62.15 Vermont Amer. 14131	40.00 200.00 Bosch HC4031	Incomplete

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Non-Electrical Hand Tools
 TIME & (March 1, 2013 through December 31, 2013)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 28, 2013

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

	5 ea. Size 1" x 10", w/1/2" SHANK Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	15.77 78.85 Drill America DAM 13x1	33.60 168.00 Trucut X100013	30.75 153.75 Dewalt DW5249	Incomplete
14.	5 ea. Size 1" x 12" Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	15.77 78.85 Drill America DAM 13x1	22.98 114.90 Vermont Amer. 14133	31.00 155.00 Dewalt DW5249	Incomplete
	Total for Item 1	TOTAL	*	728.35	1,380.50	Incomplete
ITEM 2.	DRILL BIT HAMMER, MASONRY					
1.	5 ea. Size 3/8" x 11" SPLINE Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	13.01 65.05 Dewalt DW5700	13.85 69.25 Milwaukee 48-20-4037	20.50 102.50 Bosch HC4501	40.63 203.15 Irwin 585-324002
2.	10 ea. Size 3/8" x 12" SDS Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	5.84 58.40 Dewalt DW5430	12.51 125.10 Bosch HC2064	8.00 80.00 Rock River 0259407	14.07 140.70 Irwin 585-322026
3.	5 ea. Size 3/8" x 20" SDS Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	15.98 79.90 Dewalt DW5432	20.86 104.30 Bosch HC 2067	27.50 137.50 Dewalt DW5432	27.77 138.85 Irwin 585-322028
4.	10 ea. Size 1/2" x 12" Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	7.20 72.00 Dewalt DW5439	13.81 138.10 Bosch HC 2084	9.50 95.00 Rock River 0259412	15.03 150.30 Irwin 585-322033
5.	5 ea. Size 1/2" x 16" SPLINE Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	17.12 85.60 Dewalt DW5704	22.17 110.85 Rawl 1409	25.01 125.05 Dewalt DW5704	30.80 154.00 Irwin 585-322034
6.	5 ea. Size 1/2" x 23" SPLINE Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	20.56 102.80 Dewalt DW5705	27.56 137.80 Rawl 1412	37.50 187.50 Dewalt DW5706	95.47 477.35 Irwin 585-324005
7.	5 ea. Size 1 1/2" x 23" SPLINE Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	70.62 353.10 Dewalt DW5732	75.08 375.40 Rawl 1477	95.00 475.00 Rock River 0259438	30.80 154.00 Irwin 585-324040
	Total for Item 2	TOTAL	*	1,060.80	1,202.55	1,418.35
ITEM 3.	FILES					
	10 ea. Size 6", BASTARD FLAT NICHOLSON 3467 OR APPROVED EQUAL	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	 4.38 43.80	 No Bid 375.40	 5.50 55.00	 7.70 77.00
	15 ea. Size 8", BASTARD FLAT NICHOLSON 3566 OR APPROVED EQUAL	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	 5.47 82.05	 No Bid 375.40	 6.50 97.50	 9.50 142.50
	15 ea. Size 10", BASTARD FLAT NICHOLSON 3665 OR APPROVED EQUAL	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	 6.74 101.10	 No Bid 375.40	 7.99 119.85	 11.87 178.05

Alamo Distribution, LLC
 Alamo Iron Works
 943 AT&T Center Pkwy
 San Antonio, TX 78219

MSC Industrial Supply
 121 Interpark Blvd., Ste. 1203
 San Antonio, TX 78216

PDME, Inc.
 1120 Toro Grande Drive
 Cedar Park, TX 78613

Border States Electric
 2781 Robindale Rd.
 Brownsville, TX 78526

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Non-Electrical Hand Tools
 TIME & (March 1, 2013 through December 31, 2013)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 28, 2013

Alamo Distribution, LLC
 Alamo Iron Works
 943 AT&T Center Pkwy
 San Antonio, TX 78219

MSC Industrial Supply
 121 Interpark Blvd., Ste. 1203
 San Antonio, TX 78216

PDME, Inc.
 1120 Toro Grande Drive
 Cedar Park, TX 78613

Border States Electric
 2781 Robindale Rd.
 Brownsville, TX 78526

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	Alamo Distribution, LLC	MSC Industrial Supply	PDME, Inc.	Border States Electric
	15 ea. Size 12", BASTARD FLAT NICHOLSON 3764 OR APPROVED EQUAL	9.15	137.25		No Bid	11.00 165.00	15.62 234.30
	20 ea. Size 14", BASTARD FLAT NICHOLSON 3863 OR APPROVED EQUAL	12.63	252.60		No Bid	15.50 310.00	21.48 429.60
	15 ea. Size 6", BASTARD ROUND RAT TAIL NICHOLSON 11781 OR APPROVED EQUAL	4.11	61.65		No Bid	3.01 45.15	7.65 114.75
	10 ea. Size 10", BASTARD ROUND NICHOLSON 12019 OR APPROVED EQUAL	5.14	51.40		No Bid	6.99 69.90	8.45 84.50
	40 ea. Size 14", RASP HORSE FILE NICHOLSON 18057N OR APPROVED EQUAL	17.28	691.20		No Bid	23.15 926.00	29.12 1,164.80
	Total for Item 3		1,421.05		No Bid	1,788.40	2,425.50
ITEM 4.	CHISELS						
1.	15 ea. Size 1/2", COLD Manufacturer/Model	2.35 35.25	Stanley 16-287	No Bid	8.75 131.25	Apex/Cooper 70-329	Incomplete
2.	25 ea. Size 3/4", COLD Manufacturer/Model	2.93 73.25	Stanley 16-289	No Bid	6.35 158.75	Gearwrench 82266	Incomplete
3.	35 ea. Size 1" x 7 1/2" COLD Manufacturer/Model	3.74 130.90	Stanley 16-290	No Bid	6.99 244.65	Apex/Cooper 82268	Incomplete
4.	10 ea. Size 1-1/2", WOOD Manufacturer/Model	10.75 107.50	Stanley 16-980	No Bid	16.00 160.00	Bosch HS1485	Incomplete
	Total for Item 4		346.90		No Bid	694.65	Incomplete
ITEM 5.	SAW						
1.	50 ea. SAW PVC w/blade 18" HSF180 Lenox 20980 Manufacturer/Model	15.09 754.50	Lenox 20980	No Bid	17.90 895.00	Lenox 20980HSF18	Incomplete
2.	20 ea. SAW Hand, 8 point 26" Stanley 15-526 Manufacturer/Model	4.98 99.60	Stanley 15-526	No Bid	18.00 360.00	Apex/Cooper NSP1	Incomplete
	Total for Item 5		854.10		No Bid	1,255.00	Incomplete
ITEM 6.	MISCELLANEOUS TOOLS						
1.	15 ea. Size 20" x 8-1/2" x 9-1/2", Tool Box Manufacturer/Model	62.40 936.00	Klein 54401	No Bid	NOT APPROVED		NOT APPROVED

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Non-Electrical Hand Tools
 TIME & (March 1, 2013 through December 31, 2013)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 28, 2013

Alamo Distribution, LLC
 Alamo Iron Works
 943 AT&T Center Pkwy
 San Antonio, TX 78219

MSC Industrial Supply
 121 Interpark Blvd., Ste. 1203
 San Antonio, TX 78216

PDME, Inc.
 1120 Toro Grande Drive
 Cedar Park, TX 78613

Border States Electric
 2781 Robindale Rd.
 Brownsville, TX 78526

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY					
2.	5 set Holesaw, 1/4" Arbor ADPT Metal Journeymans Set Manufacturer/Model	PRICE TOTAL MFG/MODEL	117.63 588.15 Klein 31635	165.91 829.55 Milwaukee 49-22-4175	71.99 359.95 Lenox 3990FAS900LPV	No Bid
3.	5 set Rule Folding 6 FT LUFKIN 1066D OR APPROVED EQUAL	PRICE TOTAL	13.36 66.80	15.34 76.70	10.25 51.25	25.27 126.35
4.	5 set Tape Steel Circular 1/4 x 6 FT LUFKIN W606PD OR APPROVED EQUAL	PRICE TOTAL	12.98 64.90	12.50 62.50	13.68 68.40	24.23 121.15
5.	5 set Tape Measure Non-Metal 100 FT LUFKIN HD406 OR APPROVED EQUAL	PRICE TOTAL	81.23 406.15	No Bid	NOT APPROVED	171.13 855.65
6.	20 ea. Size 26", Saw, Standard Cable MCMaster CARR 39705A31 OR APPROVED EQUAL	PRICE TOTAL	8.09 161.80	No Bid	6.00 120.00	No Bid
7.	30 ea. Size 46", Saw, Standard cable McMaster Carr 39705A32 or approved equal	PRICE TOTAL	9.35 280.50	No Bid	6.99 209.70	No Bid
8.	20 ea. Measuring Wheel, Tape, Size 0-9999 Feet Lufkin MW38 or approved equal	PRICE TOTAL	55.01 1,100.20	No Bid	45.00 900.00	126.10 2,522.00
9.	70 set Pump Utility 1 1/2 DIS 13 GPM Beckson 136PF6 or approved equal	PRICE TOTAL	41.13 2,879.10	No Bid	33.00 2,310.00	No Bid
10.	75 ea. Tape Measure OD 38IN x 10FT JIM-GEM 39480 or approved equal	PRICE TOTAL	5.71 428.25	No Bid	NOT APPROVED	No Bid
11.	15 ea. Setter Valve 4-12 IN Raptor 41038 or approved equal	PRICE TOTAL	87.80 1,317.00	No Bid	109.00 1,635.00	No Bid
12.	50 ea. Gun Grease Lever Type Lincoln 1142 or approved equal	PRICE TOTAL	19.88 994.00	23.21 1,160.50	11.00 550.00	34.45 1,722.50
	Total for Item 6	TOTAL	9,222.85	2,129.25	6,204.30	5,347.65
	TOTAL FOR ITEMS 1 THRU 6	TOTAL	13,117.00	3,918.40	12,525.40	9,191.50
ITEM 7.	Goldblatt (Stanley) Price List (Estimated Annual Usage \$15,000)			*		
	Price List Catalog Number	Cat. No.	SIT-011513	2012-2013		
	Discount Off Price List (%)	Discount	50%	53%		
	Multiplier for Discount	Discount	.5	.47		
	Effective Date of Price List	Date	1/15/13	1/1/13	Current	

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Non-Electrical Hand Tools
 TIME & (March 1, 2013 through December 31, 2013)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 28, 2013

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM 8.	Klein Price List (Estimated Annual Usage \$8,000)		* Klein 2013			
	Price List Catalog Number	Cat. No.	25%	2012-2013	Current	
	Discount Off Price List (%)	Discount	.75	12%	23%	
	Multiplier for Discount	Discount	1.5/13	.88	Current	
	Effective Date of Price List	Date		1/1/13		
ITEM 9.	Cooper Price List (Estimated Annual Usage \$8,000)		* CHT-030113			
	Price List Catalog Number	Cat. No.	40%	2012-2013	Current	
	Discount Off Price List (%)	Discount	.60	20%	23%	
	Multiplier for Discount	Discount	3/1/13	.80	Current	
	Effective Date of Price List	Date		1/1/13		
	Terms		Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days
	Delivery Days		1-2 days		5-7 days	

Alamo Distribution, LLC
 Alamo Iron Works
 943 AT&T Center Pkwy
 San Antonio, TX 78219

MSC Industrial Supply
 121 Interpark Blvd., Ste. 1203
 San Antonio, TX 78216

PDME, Inc.
 1120 Toro Grande Drive
 Cedar Park, TX 78613

Border States Electric
 2781 Robindale Rd.
 Brownsville, TX 78526

***LOW BIDDER**

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Alamo Dist. Dba AIW
 Border States Electric
 Grainger
 Morris Machine Tool & Supply
 MSC Industrial Supply
 PDME, Inc.
 Royall Matthiessen
 Tool Mart, Inc.

Demandstar
 SAWS Website